EXTRACT FROM THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : PART 11, SEC. 3, SUB-SEC. (ii)
Appearing on Page Nos. 76897694 ‘
Dated 13-11-2010

wifiew, Wires firrras qar Yo waTery
MINISTRY OF PERSONNEL PUBLIC GRIEVANCES AND PENSIONS
(Yo @ Yot wearor frar )
e
% faweht, 9 Foma, 2010

I, 3T, zsoe.—wﬁ,#ﬁm%aﬁmsaﬁdﬂﬂ%mamaﬁ309%mﬁammm
wmm@aﬁ?Wﬁ@mﬂ&naﬂ?ﬁmﬁwﬁ@mmr&wﬁﬁ%ﬁuﬁﬁﬁmmmuﬁwﬁw
mﬁ%mmﬁﬁa@m(ﬁmwm)ﬁw,1981mﬁhﬁmmmﬁ%mﬁmﬁaﬁgaﬁmm%,mh:-

1. (1) ¥ Pt <1 S T S0 fofis e (Yo s frm 2010 3

(2) #zﬁmm,zoosﬁmgmﬁ%ﬁtﬁﬁwawm#mﬁmﬁwa@ﬁwﬁm,
m%wm%mmﬁmvﬁzm,zoosﬁwm%am@ﬂ?ﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁmﬁ,ﬁmmw
n‘nvﬁm,lm'-m'(’rzoosaﬁmmmﬁﬁzﬁﬁm,zoogﬁié,wagw%,ﬂ#m%mw:ﬁwg@ﬁ@
Wﬁrwwﬁ,qéaﬂﬂfméﬂmﬁmmmmﬁaﬁw#m%m%mmﬁmﬂ 3R Ug Syl %
ﬁaﬁ,ﬁmﬁﬁmmﬁmmwﬁWmmﬁmﬁwawﬁﬁaﬁnma%wwﬁwmﬁ%qaﬁ
3 iR e & e Trhew @ wror dovhge g €, v w s |

2. %= fafem Far (Fom W) from, 198) F -

(1) Frm 3 %, sefrm (1) 3 g () & wR w fefhten o e s, s -

‘() " defre SRR @ S fofas S (YeE) fram, 1972 % Fram 50 & 3ufrm (1) & o vy 9o
wfaga & 1™

(2) Trm s = svfrem (3) & wom R frefafad safam @ s, YR

“(3) uﬁﬂnﬁwﬁvﬁa@%ﬁﬁmm%ﬁﬂmﬁaﬁﬁ%?ﬁmﬁmﬁmm
+ 4R um ) Brg fe S 17

&) me%m(z)%mwmmwm,mﬁ[:——

“(2) ﬁm9m1‘—m¢rIoﬁﬁﬁwwmﬁmﬁ,mmWWWﬁmﬁwmﬁm
w%ﬁmﬁmﬁ'mﬁm(l)a&m%@t(ﬁ)mm(@)ﬁum#ﬁm@wﬁmmﬁ@‘fﬁﬁ
st |

(4) Tram 9 R 39Fwm (3) B—(%F) &e (1) sl & (i) § "< v ol @ wow v, wE-ww A o 8
FH: T T R 1@ ;o (@) WE () T um v S v “yfea” we E S

(5) Trm 10 %, (F) "Am" Wg & w0 W wfreem” v @ o (@) “T TR IR & W W, e
el 3 3 ¥, “oe wuR” W T

(6) Fraw 10 * weaiq Frfafeaa fram Tan smam, sy —

“10%. aft el Yo st ) weiea i @, P 6 @ s S @ v e @ s
T HH T H Wi @ vxe a9 qof w8 R v few e

, ﬂ!‘gﬁ#ﬁwﬁﬁnﬁ]aﬁﬁmﬁwaﬂﬁméwwﬂnﬁaﬁwm%mwma’rt‘r'mﬁm:
wRiIg af, wafi arire (ARrE) @ sy o gof B9 W wemad e e 17
(7) Prw 129 ds (i) ¥ “geg aon” we @ e e s,
1




2

(8) from 22 % wafrem (1) = (@) & “TEER” I M W “T7 TR y= @ o,

(9) Fram 31 §—(i) “@ﬁ‘f”mﬁm‘mm,aﬁmém%ﬂ‘@gw”,mt@m;(ii) ‘g y
* WH W, TE Wl 3 oRF, e s @ o :

(10) ﬁuqazﬁ,“wﬁasﬁtmﬁﬁ-gwﬁm"mﬁﬁww,“&maﬂtﬁ?ﬁﬂhﬁwﬁw"w@
e

(11) w33 o “wﬁmaﬁtwmﬁwgﬂnﬁm"waﬁwmm, Yy stk derst s faem v v
ElLuf

(12) T 3, fram 4, fram 11, Fraw 12, fraw 13, fraw 14, Brm 15, frm 16, P9 17, Frgw 18, fram 19,
frm 26 st fram 27 & “m"w%ww,mméa}rﬁ?,"uﬁm“wr@w;

(13) ¥ Frawl @ Sveg Wl % wm W Frefafer geon et s, Yl

Qi

T T A v @ fer st gea
| S, 2006 W e

[ 3 (1) (%),8,26 (7),28 (5) 3R 29 (1) aer 29 (2) 2figm )

g o Qe e g S p— B T S p—————
AT T 3 TG & w9 T ® FY T & ¥ e T 39 w1 arfisR walt-

¥ stfsraa ¥ sfieraq F e
wueipa 7ea TR e N

1 2 3 4 5 6 )
20 9.188 4] 9.075 62 8093
21 9.187 42 9.059 63 7.982
2 9.186 43 9.040 64 7.862
7 9.185 44 9.019 65 7.731

2% 9.184 45 8.996 66 7.591

25 9.183 46 8971 67 7.431

% 9,182 47 8.943 68 7.262
27 9.180 48 8913 6 ' 7.083

p 9.178 49 8.881 70 6.897
29 9.176 50 8.846 71 6.703

30 9.173 51 8.808 72 6.502

31 9.169 52 8.768 B 6.296
32 9.164 53 8.724 74 6.085

33 9.159 54 8.678 75 5872

34 9.152 55 8.627 76 5.657

35 9.145 56 8.572 77 5.443

36 9.136 57 8,512 8 5229
37 9.126 58 8.446 79 5018

38 9116 59 8.371 80 4.8i2

39 9.103 60 8287 8] 461t"

40 9.090 61 8194




WEIHTT AT

o3 S5 AT Waﬁﬁwﬁﬁ?&w#m,mﬁﬁmﬁﬁ,@mﬁ,mﬁmﬁ%%m
1 farifel raffm 2 off, e w1 sy @ T # | T e fo e 3 i et w6t 31 syt
uE <A ¥ et =fm @ fea WS gfme w7 vea

foaror : 35 faferer dan (Yo wwfteton) weitvm frem, 1981 =1 sfigen T 34/1/81 99 gfie a1 8 e,
1983 BRI U1 HUR #5137, 1134 T 11 o1, 1981 GR1 Fohiers foraqr v e oy wegwsr Yor ik Somsi s
fawm =1 Frerfeafea sifumiet gro woifia fem mn or -

FH WAl sfvrge vem RIECH

1. FLAL G, 1870 04-05-1985
2 H.3. 9, 2097 ‘ 18-05--1985
3 ] 1775 19-07--1997
4. .. 4. 918 28-02-2002
5. F1.37. H. 1484(H) 30-12-2003

[P 6. 42/23/10-Foedte=y (i) |

(DEPARTM_ENT OFPENSIONAND PENSIONERS WELFARE)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 9th November, 2010

5. 0. 2806.—In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to article 309 read with clause (5) of article 148
of the Constitution and after consultation with the Comptroller and Auditor General in relation to persons serving in the
Indian Audit and Accounts Department, the President hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Central Civil
Services {Commutation of Pension) Rules, 1981, namely :-—

1. (1) These rules may be called the Central Civil Services (Commutation of Pension) Amendment Rules, 2010,

(2) They shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 2nd September, 2008 and the reviscd Table
of Commutation Value for Pension, appended to these rules shall be used for all commutation of pension which becomes
absolute from the 2nd September 2008 and in the case of pensioners whose commutation of pension became absolute on
or after 1st January, 2006 but before 2nd September, 2008, the pre revised Table of Commutation Value for Pension shall be
used for payment of commutation of pension based on pre revised pay or pension and in respect of such pensioners, the
revised Table of Commutation Value for Pension, appended to these rules shall be used for the commutation of additional
amount of pension that has become commutable on account of retrospective revision of pay and pension.

2. In the Central Civil Services (Commutation of Pension) Rules, 198 | —
(1) inrule 3, sub-rule (1), for clause (d), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :—
“(d) “Retirement gratuity” means the gratuity payable under sub-rufe (1) of rule 50 of the CCS (Pension)
rules, 1972
(2) inrule 5, for sub-rule (3), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely ;—
“(3) Ifthe percentage of pension to be commuted results in fraction of rupee, such fraction shall be ignored for the
purpose of commutation.”™;
(3) inrule 6, for sub-rule (2), the foliowing sub-rule shall be substituted, namely :—

(2) Inthe case of an applicant referred to in rule 9 or rule | 0 the commuted value is paid in two or more stages, the
reduction in the amount of pension shall be made from the respective dates of the payments as laid down in
clause (a) or clausﬂe (b) of the provise to sub-rule (1).";
(4Y in rule 9, in sub-rule (3}, (a) in clauses (i} and (i), for the words “two thousand”, wherever they occur, the
words “six thousand” shall respectively be substituted; and (b) in clause (i), for the word “fraction” the word
“percentage” shall be substituted,;




4

(5) inrule 10, (ay for the word *“fraction” the word “percentage” shall be substituted; (b) for the words “two

thousand”, wherever: they occur, the words “six ‘thousand” shall be substituted; .

{6) after rule’'10; theifoHowing niteshat| be substituted, namely :\—

“10A. Restoration of commuted pension,—The commuted amount of the pension shall be restored on completion of

fiftcen years. from.the date the reduction of pension on account of commutation becomes operative in accor-
dance with.rule’s :

Providedithat whenthe commutation amount was paid on more than one occasion on account of upward revision
of pension, thexespective commuted amount of the pension shall be restored on compietion of fifteen years from
the respective date(s).”;

(7) inrule 12, in clause (tii), the words “death-cum-" shall be omitted;

(8} in rule 22, in sub rule (1), in clause (b), for the words “two thousand”, the words “six thousand” shall be
substituted,

(9) in rule 31, (i) for the words “one hundred”, wherever they occur, the words “six thousand” shall be
substituted; {ii) for the word “fraction” wherever it occurs, the word “percentage” shall be substituted;

(10) in rule 32, for the words “Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms”, the words “Department of
Pension and Pensioners Welfare” shall be substituted:

(11) inrule 33, for the words “Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms”, the words “Department of
Pension and Pensioners Welfare” shall be substituted;

(12) inrules,3,4,11,12, 13, 14, 15,16, 17, 18,19, 26 and 27 for the words “fraction” wherever it occurs, the word
“percentage” shall respectively be substituted:

(13) for the table appended to these rules, the following table shall be substituted namely -
TABLE

“Commutation Values For A Pension of Rs. | Per Annumnt
Effective from st January, 2006

[seerules 3(1) (m) 8,26 (7),28 (5)and 29 (1) and 29 )]

Age next Commutation Age next Commutation Age next Commutation
birthday value expressed  birthday value expressed  birthday value expressed
as number of as number of as number of
year’s purchase year’s purchase year's purchase
i 2 3 4 5 5
-0 0.188 41 9.075 62 8.093
21 G187 2 9.059 63 7.682
2 9186 43 9.040 iz 7.862
pL} 9.188 44 %.019 65 7.731
2 9.184 45 899 66 7.59]
25 9.183 46 8.971 67 7431
2 G182 47 8.543 68 7.262
27 9.180 48 8913 & 7.083
28 0178 49 8.881 70 6.897
29 2.176 50 8.846 ! 6.703
30 9.173 5t 8.808 72 6.502
31 9.169 52 8.768 73 6296
32 9.164 53 8724 74 6.085
33 9.159 4 3678 75 5872
M 9.152 55 8.627 76 5.657
35 9145 56 8572 77 5443




5

i 2 3 4 5 5

36 2.136 57 8512 78 5.229
37 - 9126 38 8446 o 5018
38 9116 5% 8371 80 4812
39 9.103 60 8287 8 4601
40 9.090 6l 8.1

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

Due to implementation of the recommendations of the sixth Central Pay Commission, it has become necessary 1o give
retrospective effect to the proposed amendments from the date from which the recommendations of the Sixth Central Pay
Commission were given effect to. It is certified that the interest of no person is adversely affected by giving retrospective
effect to the proposed amendments. '

Note : The Central Civil Services (Commutation of Pension) Amendment Rules, 1981 were published vide S. 0. 1134 daied
Ith April, 1981 as amended by notification No. 34/1/81 Pension Unit dated the 8th July, 1983 and were subseguently
amended vide Department of Pension and Pensioners’ Welfare Notification as given below:

S. No. Notification No. Date L
1 S.0.No. 1870 04-05-1985
2 8.0.No. 2097 18-05-1985
3. S8.0.No. 1775 19-07-1997
4 8.0.No. 918 28-02-2002
5 S.0. No. |484(E) 30-12-2003

{F. No. 42/23/10-P&PW (G|
RAJ SINGH, Jt. Secy.

MGIPRRND—4411 PPG&P/10-—-100 Copies




